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HISTORY (B.A.)
As a field of study, History provides students with many of the necessary
skills for a productive professional career and an intellectually fulfilling
life. Toward these ends, the History major attempts to provide students
with the ability to think and read critically and analytically, to form
sound opinions and support them with logical arguments based on
documentary evidence, to communicate ideas effectively, and to
conduct historical research. The History major further attempts to
provide students with a body of historical knowledge that will enable
them to understand contemporary events of local, national, and global
importance, as well as to understand and appreciate the various cultures
and civilizations that make up the world community. Above all, the
History major helps to provide students with the means for lifelong
learning.

By combining the development of specific skills with the acquisition of
a body of historical knowledge, the History major prepares students for
successful careers in primary and secondary education (history and
social studies), business and industry, and governmental service. The
major also prepares students for graduate study in history, law, and other
academic and professional fields.

Students of History are strongly advised to acquire reading proficiency in
at least one foreign language. Reading knowledge of at least one foreign
language is essential for all students who intend to apply to graduate
school.

In order to assess the efficacy of student learning in the above areas, the
history department has developed a list of learning outcomes by course-
level. They focus on students' facility with historical knowledge, and
measurements of their critical thinking, reading, and writing skills.


